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Fwd: Award Letter of Project under Special Call on Covid-19

Bibhunandini Das <bibhunandini.das@cutm.ac.in> Wed, Dec 29, 2021 at 2:00 PM
To: Sanjay Nayak <sanjay.nayak@cutm.ac.in>

Bibhunandini Das

PhD (CDS-JNU)

Associate Professor

School of Management

Centurion University of Technology and Management
Ramachandrapur

Jatni-Khurda

Bhubaneswar- 752050

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Dr Smita Mishra Panda <smita.mishra@cutm.ac.in>

Date: Wed, Dec 29, 2021 at 1:44 PM

Subject: Fwd: Award Letter of Project under Special Call on Covid-19
To: Bibhunandini Das <bibhunandini.das@cutm.ac.in>

THis is the ICSSR one. | am sending you the Norwegian funding letter soon.

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: ICSSR Special Call <icssr.specialcall@gmail.com>

Date: Wed, Jan 27, 2021 at 4:44 PM

Subject: Award Letter of Project under Special Call on Covid-19

To: Dr Smita Mishra Panda <smita.mishra@cutm.ac.in>, <president@cutm.ac.in>

Pushkar Pathak Indian Council of Social Science Research
Systems Analyst (Ministry of Education)
Computer Centre Aruna Asaf Ali Marg, New Delhi — 110067
7®011- 26741459 EPABX: 26741849-51 Fax: 91-11-26741936
E-mail: icssr.specialcall@gmail.com Website: www.icssr.org

File No. ICSSR/364/1/2021-22 Dated: 27/01/2021

Subject: Award Letter of Project under Special Call on Covid-19
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Dear Dr. Smita Mishra Panda,

Please refer to your application against our special call on Covid-19 projects, you could recall that you
were shortlisted and made your presentation followed by online discussion with our experts. Now based
on opinion of expert committee, you have been finally selected for the award of project with following
details:

Title of Project: Women and Domestic Violence During Times of COVID-19:Insights from
Odisha

Budget Approved: Rs. 280000/-

We would like you to submit all required documents and an undertaking on a non-judicial stamp paper
of Rs. 100/- (list of documents enclosed) in 7 days so that sanction order and first instalment i.e. 25%
of total budget approved may be released through PFMS which is mandatory for transferring any
Government grant.

In case you fulfil all eligibility criteria mentioned in guidelines, you may commence your Research Study
immediately. Meanwhile, after verification of your documents, a formal sanction order will be issued
and grant will be transferred as per grant-in-aid bill to your affiliating institute.

It is reiterated that all Payments and Transfers are to be made through EAT module therefore the
affiliating institutions are required to register themselves under ICSSR Scheme (0877) through PFMS.
In case, affiliating institution is already registered, there is no need to register again and for any query
related to PFMS issue, you/your affiliating institute may contact our finance division official, Mr.
Subhash Chand, Tel:011-26742830; Email:icssrfin.nd@gmail.com.

Regards,

Yours truly,

(Pushkar Pathak)

Dr. Smita Mishra Panda
Centurion University of Technology, Bhubaneswar, Odisha

Enclosures:
As mentioned above.

5 attachments
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