JOH 3y} jJo ainjeu

W ) /%@3

-V NP I00 Oof

Sw\«sr U —

0§ Lol

103Ul 3Y}JO 4njeusk

6

\ 8

77

9

S

. . \ / rott

ey Wt o |\ | = | M| oY | Bk | PK| 8b |eeecTehedbl ey UG

»egi/».ﬂ T / - co| aN 3\/ a\/ +% omeoNkao&.._c.\ §3_\< ol
\»_:M%\g 57 % SMN\Q? oV é ], g, | [ceolThotlbT| [¥og FWFTWoNT 1 |
sjuapnis sanp sainseaw wo|qo.d mDMMOm_um Huw.—onwsm Cw>“”wwu—ww pi023y %9 - co_umhum_mwm use "ON ’
ay1 jo ainjeudis | Suipuad | aAnda.10) | |eUOSIad soeg | sanoa mc_rumwh Sujuleaq [ouepuany : ' N ‘s

o5

YVYMSINVENHE ‘S3D

u@v :JOJU3IA 9Y3] JO SWEN hng :awep juawnedaqg

19S HL1V3H @311V ANV SJ133NVEVd 40 TOOHIS
IN3IWIOVYNVIN ANV ADOTONHIIL 0 ALISHIAINA NOIMNLNID




.

4/4/23, 4:58 PM

Supriya

Centurion University of Technology and Management Mail - Fwd: Request for sparing me 1o pay extra amount charged by auth, ., l

Mobile: +91 8825864370

On Wed, Dec 22, 2021 at 10:31 AM Vice Chancellor CUTM <vc@cutm.ac.in> wrote:

Dear Soumya,

Would you please find out some more details about this student. Also glve me her performance and tell me how much
is her due till she completes her course.

Regards,

Prof. Supriya Paltanayak, Ph.D.
Vice Chancellor

Centurion
UNIVERSITY

Shepring Lt
Popermectng Commamiies!

Centurion University of Technology and Management, Odisha
http://www.cutm.ac.in

Mob: +91 - 9437009777

Forwarded message ---------

From: NEHASHREE SAMRAT . <191704210021@cutm.ac.in>

Date: Sun, Dec 19, 2021 at 2:55 PM

Subject: Request for sparing me to pay extra amount charged by authority
To: VC CUTM <vc@cutm.ac.in>, VC Office CUTM <vcoffice@cutm.ac.in>

Cec: Sunil Kumar Jha <s.jha@cutm.ac.in>, Soumya Jal <soumya.jal@cutm.ac.in>, PRAKASH KVD
<prakash.kvd@cutm.ac.in>

Respected Madam,

| am Nehashree Samrat, a student of BSc MRT (2019-22 Batch), School of Paramedics and Allied Health Sciences. In
the month of July, my father passed away all of a sudden due to brain hemorrhage and-he was the only one in my
family supporting my education as well as the education of my siblings. Due to the death of my father, |'am unable to
stay in the hostel for 68 days i.e from 9th August, 2021 to 14th October, 2021. My family has been financially not at a
state to pay college dues as there is no other way of earning for our family. Hewas a salaried person and bearing all
the expenses from his monthly salary.

Now there is no one to bear my educational expenses and the hostel is charging 4000 more for that two months / the
absentees days. | request you to please consider my situation and my financial crisis. Please spare me from paying
the amount being asked to pay for the two months. | am sure you would consider my request at your foremost. I'll be
Highly obliged for your act of kindness. :

Thanking You Y
Yours Sincerely,

Regards,

Nehashree Samrat

Registration ID: 191704210021

BSc MRT (2019-22 Batch),

School of Paramedics and Allied Health Sciences, Bhubaneswar.
Odisha.

Mobile no. -: 9304463970

Dr. Soumya Jal

Associate Professor & HoD

School of Paramedics & Allied Health Sclences, Bhubaneswar Campus
Centurion University of Technology & Management

Odisha

Mobile: +91 8825864370
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Fwd: Request for sparing me to pay extra amount charged by authority
2 messages

Soumya Jal <soumya.jal@cutm.ac.in> Tue, Apr 4, 2023 at 12:01 PM
To: Salony Pattnaik <salony.pattnaik@cutm.ac.in>, Rajat Kumar Ray <rajat.ray@cutm.ac.in>
Cc: "SPHAS Faculty@ BBS" <spahs.bbs@cutm.ac.in>

-———— Forwarded message ———-

From: Vice Chancellor CUTM <vc@cutm.ac.in>

Date: Thu, Dec 23, 2021 at 10:44 PM

Subject: Re: Request for sparing me to pay extra amount charged by authority

To: Soumya Jal <soumya.jal@cutm.ac.in>

Cc: Sunil Kumar Jha <s jha@cutm.ac.in>, Debasis Panda <debasis.panda@cutm.ac.in>, Nabin Dash
<nabin.dash@cutm.ac.in>

Dear Soumya,

Thank you so much for your detailed report.

Dear Nabin,

We should waive off the fees for the period of absence.
Dear Debasish,

Please review the status of her fees and refund.
Regards,

Supriya

On Thu, 23 Dec 2021, 08:19 Soumya Jal, <soumya.jal@cutm.ac.in> wrote:

| Respected Madam,

Ms. Nehashree Samrat is a bright student of BSc MRT final year. She has a CGPA of 8.5 till 4th Sem (with an SGPA
above 8 points in each sem; 5th Sem results are awaited).

As per my interaction with her, Ms. Nehashree Samrat is pursuing her BSc MRT degree through a Study loan from Bihar
Credit loan. She was sanctioned with Rs. 4,00,000 (Academic fee + Hostel fee) from the bank.

Break up for sanctioned study loan:

1st Year: Rs 90,000 (Academic fee)

2nd Year: Rs 1,55,000 (i.e. Rs 90,000 Academic fee + Rs 65,000 Hostel fee)

3rd Year: Rs 1,55,000 (i.e. Rs 90,000 Academic fee + Rs 65,000 Hostel fee)

As informed by the student, all the above fees have already been credited to the account of CUTM from the bank
(Details of the transaction are attached)

Issues:

1. The student is asked to pay Rs 4000 hostel fee (for Aug- Sept, 2021). The student had not reported to the campus
during that period due to the demise of her father in the month of July, 2021. She is requesting to forfeit Rs 4000 as she
had not reported to the hostel. She rejoined the hotel on 15th October 2021 and has paid the hostel fee from Oct- Dec
2021 (through the study loan from the bank).

2. As there was a delay from the bank in sending the loan for the 3rd-year academic fee, she had to pay Rs 45,000 (copy
of the receipt attached) from her own resources.

Later CUTM has received Rs. 1,55,000 from the bank (details attached), but the expenses were Rs 1,18,000.

Break up:

Rs 90,000 Academic fee e

Rs 21,000 Hostel fee (as the hostel charges are 21,000 for 3 months and she has not stayed for another 3 months due

to her father's death)

Rs 7,000 Examination fee
So she is requesting the refund of the excess amount of Rs 82,000 credited to CUTM which is she has submitted an

application to Accounts department.

(The UTR No. may be verified by the accounts section as she doesn't hjave any receipt for the transaction of study loan
from the bank to CUTM)

Regards,

Dr. Soumya Jal

Associate Professor & HoD ; ;
School of Paramedics and Allied Health Sciences, B SaRESwEE Calmils 30 2
Centurion University of Technology and Mana&éqﬁbﬁf’ammedics & Allied Hoalth Seionces
Odisha Centurion Usiversity of Technology & Wers:
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